



CITY COUNCIL AGENDA ITEM

REQUESTED COUNCIL MEETING DATE 07/25/06

SUBJECT: Award of Pavilion Kitchen Bid # B 06-15

DEPARTMENT: Parks & Recreation

RECOMMENDED MOTION:

Staff recommends the City Council award the Pavilion Kitchen Bid # B 06-15 to Beltram Food Service Group, from Tampa, Florida in the amount \$38,442.27.

SUMMARY:

The City issued a bid for miscellaneous items for the Pavilion Kitchen. The bid tally sheet is attached for your review. In order to bring the bid into budget; staff deleted items that were not essential to the kitchen operations. The lowest responsible bidder is Beltram Food Services Group, Inc, from Tampa, Florida, in the amount of \$38,442.27. Staff recommends that the City Council award this bid to Beltram for that amount.

ATTACHMENTS: Ordinance Resolution Budget Resolution

Other Support Documents/Contracts Available for Review in Manager's Office

DEPARTMENT HEAD

Glen Walker
Glen Walker, Recreation Director

Date 7/12/06

FINANCE DEPARTMENT

Jana Stelly
Approved as to Budget Requirements

Date 7/17/06

CITY ATTORNEY

Approved as to Form and Legality

Date

CITY MANAGER

[Signature]

Approved Agenda Item For:

Date 7/25/06

COUNCIL ACTION:

Indefinitely

Approved as Recommended

Disapproved

Tabled

Continued to Date Certain

Approved with Modification:

	Beltram	Central	LACE	Sarasota	Gulf	Great Lakes Design
Item # 1-Con. Oven	\$ 10,005.75	\$ 9,206.45	\$ 11,821.00	\$ 9,585.00	No Bid	\$ 10,648.00
Item # 2-Gas Range	\$ 5,176.29	\$ 4,663.00	\$ 7,560.00	\$ 5,209.20	No Bid	\$ 5,544.00
Item # 3- Gas Fryers (2)	\$ 9,994.00	\$ 9,471.00	\$ 10,807.00	\$ 8,299.57	No Bid	\$ 10,828.00
Item # 4 - Belt Conveyor	\$ 8,200.00	\$ 8,069.00	\$ 9,354.00	\$ 7,723.08	No Bid	\$ 8,514.00
Item # 5- Holding Oven	\$ 5,457.53	\$ 5,400.00	\$ 6,194.00	\$ 4,950.48	No Bid	\$ 5,010.00
Item # 6 - SS Sink	\$ 3,098.81	\$ 3,150.00	\$ 3,725.00	\$ 3,142.67	No Bid	\$ 3,480.00
Item # 6A SS Wall Shelf	\$ 374.75	\$ 439.00	\$ 467.00	\$ 366.28	No Bid	\$ 445.00
Item # 7-Dish Machine	\$ 4,335.69	\$ 5,144.00	\$ 5,049.00	\$ 4,331.12	No Bid	\$ 4,411.00
Item # 8 - Food Warmer	\$ 5,716.85	\$ 5,257.00	\$ 7,098.00	\$ 5,606.06	No Bid	\$ 6,538.00
Item # 9-Serving System	\$ 4,224.03	\$ 4,175.00	\$ 5,195.00	\$ 4,185.05	No Bid	\$ 4,816.00
Item # 10-Horiz.Freezer	\$ 902.71	\$ 1,031.00	\$ 1,617.00	\$ 915.88	No Bid	\$ 1,173.00
Item # 11-Refrigerator	\$ 2,124.31	\$ 2,173.00	\$ 3,349.00	\$ 2,080.95	No Bid	\$ 2,450.00
Item # 12-SS Bot. Freezer	\$ 3,087.00	\$ 2,944.00	\$ 3,630.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,232.00
Item # 13/14 Ice Cuber/Bir	\$ 4,720.65	\$ 4,671.00	\$ 6,221.00	4141.46***	3744.65***	\$ 5,744.00
Item # 15 Coffee Urn	\$ 2,240.11	\$ 2,281.00	\$ 2,427.00	\$ 1,727.14	No Bid	\$ 1,692.00
Item # 16 Popcorn Pop.	\$ 4,928.35	\$ 5,869.00	\$ 6,358.00	\$ 4,994.73	No Bid	\$ 5,417.00
Item # 17 Exhaust Hood	\$ 7,682.34	\$ 11,937.00	\$ 8,865.00	\$ 9,345.01	No Bid	\$ 10,178.00
Item # 19 SS Sink	\$ 4,047.84	\$ 3,412.00	\$ 4,854.00	\$ 4,119.39	No Bid	\$ 4,548.00
Item # 19-1 Wall Shelf	\$ 357.12	\$ 680.13	\$ 444.00	\$ 349.87	No Bid	\$ 375.00
Item 19-A Waste Disposer	\$ 1,467.91	\$ 1,825.00	\$ 1,499.00	\$ 1,913.44	No Bid	\$ 1,948.00
Item # 19A-1 Hobart Acc.	Incl	Incl	Incl	Incl	No Bid	Incl
Item # 19 B SS Table	\$ 896.10	\$ 729.52	\$ 477.00	\$ 843.67	No Bid	\$ 951.00
Item # 19B-1 Drawers	Incl	Incl	\$ 678.00	Incl	No Bid	Incl
Item # 20 Work table	\$ 1,525.00	\$ 1,413.00	\$ 1,502.00	\$ 1,445.63	No Bid	\$ 1,661.00
LABOR				\$ 2,000.00		\$ 8,500.00
Freight				\$ 1,500.00		
TOTAL	\$ 90,563.14	\$ 93,940.10	\$ 106,534.00	\$ 88,775.68	\$ 3,744.65	\$ 95,991.00
Essential Items Only	\$ 38,442.27	\$ 42,310.52	\$ 48,589.00	\$ 42,579.83		\$ 43,489.00
						\$ 41,795.00